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There's never a dull moment for the residents of Beaumont, South Carolina. Lately, a heat wave's spiked the
mercury-and everyone's sex drive! These days, when Jamie runs into Max, it's all she can do not to tear his
clothes off-and the feeling is mutual. But trouble seems to follow Max like moths to a flame, and Jamie
suspects he's all wrong for her. Meanwhile, the lingerie shop is having a sale on edible underwear, while the
bakery's selling aphrodisiac-laced brownies and x-rated birthday cakes. Even Jamie's dog, Fleas, is dodging
passes from the amorous French poodle next door! But when someone starts bumping off some of the town's
more annoying citizens, all clues lead straight to the new personals section in Jamie's newspaper. Pretty
soon, things are getting hot and heavy, as Max and Jamie start uncovering secrets-and undressing each
other...
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From reader reviews:

Irving Hansen:

The book Full Blast (Janet Evanovich's Full Series Book 4) can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. Why must we leave the good thing like a book Full Blast (Janet Evanovich's Full
Series Book 4)? Several of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim this book can give
many details for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge
or facts that you take for that, you can give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Full Blast
(Janet Evanovich's Full Series Book 4) has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can appear the enormous world by open up and read a publication. So it is very
wonderful.

Bonnie Mentzer:

The knowledge that you get from Full Blast (Janet Evanovich's Full Series Book 4) will be the more deep
you digging the information that hide inside the words the more you get considering reading it. It does not
mean that this book is hard to know but Full Blast (Janet Evanovich's Full Series Book 4) giving you joy
feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood through anyone
who read the idea because the author of this book is well-known enough. That book also makes your current
vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style
are available. We highly recommend you for having this particular Full Blast (Janet Evanovich's Full Series
Book 4) instantly.

Barbie Brookins:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information currently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider when those information which is inside former life are challenging to be find than now could be
taking seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you understand it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you.
All of those possibilities will not happen within you if you take Full Blast (Janet Evanovich's Full Series
Book 4) as your daily resource information.

James Pitts:

This book untitled Full Blast (Janet Evanovich's Full Series Book 4) to be one of several books in which best
seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit onto it.
You will easily to buy this particular book in the book retail outlet or you can order it by means of online.
The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, since you can read
this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason for you to past this book from your list.
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