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Covers the complete history of Audi from 1899-2009, in fascinating text and 1,000 illustrations

From the very start, the four interlinked rings were the brand emblem of Auto Union AG, the second-largest
German motor-vehicle manufacturer when the company was formed in the town of Chemnitz in 1932. The
rings symbolized the indissoluble character of the entity created by the merger of four motor-vehicle brands
from the German state of Saxony: Audi, DKW, Horch and Wanderer. This emblem summarized the tradition
of car and motorcycle construction in that region, already many decades old, and was also evidence of the
companies' determination to continue shaping the future of the motor vehicle. Today, Audi AG makes the
same statement with its four-ring emblem: awareness of tradition, orientation toward the future.

Four Rings: The Audi Story presents the history of Audi comprehensively and in a stimulating, highly
informative manner, and includes company and product history data. The reader will be taken on a journey
through a century of modern history and will experience the profound economic changes that occurred
during this period. More than a thousand illustrations bear witness to the developments during this exciting
period, and there are tables that round off the factual information provided and give the book the character of
a work of reference.
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From reader reviews:

Kyle Coffman:

Here thing why this kind of Four Rings: The Audi Story are different and reputable to be yours. First of all
reading through a book is good but it really depends in the content of it which is the content is as delicious as
food or not. Four Rings: The Audi Story giving you information deeper including different ways, you can
find any guide out there but there is no guide that similar with Four Rings: The Audi Story. It gives you thrill
reading journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing which happened in the world which is perhaps
can be happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your means home by
train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe the form of Four Rings: The
Audi Story in e-book can be your alternative.

Matthew Thompson:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the title Four Rings: The Audi
Story suitable to you? The book was written by well known writer in this era. Often the book untitled Four
Rings: The Audi Storyis a single of several books in which everyone read now. This book was inspired a
number of people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new dimensions that you ever
know just before. The author explained their idea in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to
understand the core of this e-book. This book will give you a great deal of information about this world now.
To help you see the represented of the world in this book.

William Sinclair:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity this is look different you can
read a new book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent
the whole day to reading a book. The book Four Rings: The Audi Story it doesn't matter what good to read.
There are a lot of those who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. In case
you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to
read this book from a smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book has high quality.

Nathan Strong:

This Four Rings: The Audi Story is great e-book for you because the content that is certainly full of
information for you who all always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. This kind
of book reveal it facts accurately using great arrange word or we can say no rambling sentences included. So
if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight
forward sentences but tricky core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having Four Rings: The
Audi Story in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say
that no reserve that offer you world in ten or fifteen second right but this publication already do that. So , this



really is good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt in which?
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