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During the first half of the twentieth century, Adolf Meyer was the most authoritative and influential
psychiatrist in the United States. In 1908, when the Johns Hopkins Hospital established the first American
university clinic devoted to psychiatry?still a nascent medical specialty at the time?Meyer was selected to
oversee the enterprise. The Henry Phipps Psychiatric Clinic opened in 1913, and Meyer served as
psychiatrist-in-chief at the hospital until 1941.

In Pathologist of the Mind, S. D. Lamb explores how Meyer used his powerful position to establish
psychiatry as a clinical science that operated like the other academic disciplines at the country’s foremost
medical school. In addition to successfully arguing for a scientific and biological approach to mental illness,
Meyer held extraordinary sway over state policies regarding the certification of psychiatrists. He also trained
hundreds of specialists who ultimately occupied leadership positions and made significant contributions in
psychiatry, neurology, experimental psychology, social work, and public health.

Although historians have long recognized Meyer’s authority, his concepts and methods have never before
received a systematic historical analysis. His convoluted theory of "psychobiology," along with his
notoriously ineffective attempts to explain it in print, continue to baffle many clinicians. Pathologist of the
Mind aims to rediscover Meyerian psychiatry by eavesdropping on Meyer’s informal and private
conversations with his patients and colleagues. Weaving together private correspondence and uniquely
detailed case histories, Lamb examines Meyer’s efforts to institute a clinical science of psychiatry in the
United States?one that harmonized the expectations of scientific medicine with his concept of the person as a
biological organism and mental illness as an adaptive failure. The first historian ever granted access to these
exceptional medical records, Lamb offers a compelling new perspective on the integral but misunderstood
legacy of Adolf Meyer.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Marburger:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As you may
know that book is very important for us. The book Pathologist of the Mind: Adolf Meyer and the Origins of
American Psychiatry had been making you to know about other information and of course you can take more
information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The e-book Pathologist of the Mind: Adolf Meyer
and the Origins of American Psychiatry is not only giving you a lot more new information but also to be
your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your e-book.
Try to make relationship with all the book Pathologist of the Mind: Adolf Meyer and the Origins of
American Psychiatry. You never truly feel lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Larry Parrish:

This Pathologist of the Mind: Adolf Meyer and the Origins of American Psychiatry book is not really
ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book
is information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper an individual
read a lot of information you will get. This kind of Pathologist of the Mind: Adolf Meyer and the Origins of
American Psychiatry without we comprehend teach the one who reading it become critical in pondering and
analyzing. Don't always be worry Pathologist of the Mind: Adolf Meyer and the Origins of American
Psychiatry can bring whenever you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' become full because
you can have it in the lovely laptop even telephone. This Pathologist of the Mind: Adolf Meyer and the
Origins of American Psychiatry having very good arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not
experience uninterested in reading.

Patricia Howard:

Pathologist of the Mind: Adolf Meyer and the Origins of American Psychiatry can be one of your beginning
books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this publication has good
vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining
however delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to get every word into satisfaction
arrangement in writing Pathologist of the Mind: Adolf Meyer and the Origins of American Psychiatry but
doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm resource information that
maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information can easily drawn you into brand-new stage of
crucial imagining.

Aurora Ammon:

This Pathologist of the Mind: Adolf Meyer and the Origins of American Psychiatry is new way for you who
has attention to look for some information since it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you upon it getting
knowledge more you know or you who still having small amount of digest in reading this Pathologist of the



Mind: Adolf Meyer and the Origins of American Psychiatry can be the light food in your case because the
information inside this book is easy to get through anyone. These books create itself in the form which is
reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in e-book form make them
feel tired even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a reserve especially this
one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-
book sort for your better life and knowledge.
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