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Completing a monumental project that began with publication of The War Years in 1970, this final set of
volumes of The Papers of Dwight David Eisenhower contains 1,783 documents drawn from Eisenhower's
second term as president from 20 January 1957 to 20 January 1961. In these years Eisenhower worked hard
to hold the focus of American national politics on the two major objectives he had set for his presidency in
1952: to sustain the policy of containment without precipitating a war with the Soviet Union and to reduce
the role of the federal government in U.S. domestic affairs. In both cases, events at home and abroad
intruded?diverting attention to immediate problems, endangering the peace, and forcing the White House to
devote most of its leadership to the crises of the day.

As president during this tense period, Eisenhower maintained an extensive and revealing correspondence
with prominent individuals as well as with personal friends. These letters, together with the occasional
entries made in his diary, shed considerable light upon the major national concerns of the 1950s. The
volumes also include private and secret correspondence previously unavailable to scholars. Some of these
items have been only recently declassified, and many appear here in print for the first time. Taken as a
whole, the Eisenhower papers from 1957-61 provide firm documentary evidence of the manner in which
Eisenhower dealt with the complex internal and external problems faced by all of our modern political
leaders.
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From reader reviews:

Andrew Waite:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they're still students or it for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has various personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great along with important the book The Papers of Dwight David
Eisenhower: The Presidency: Keeping the Peace (Volume 19). All type of book could you see on many
options. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Kristi Goins:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important normally. The book The Papers of Dwight David Eisenhower: The
Presidency: Keeping the Peace (Volume 19) was making you to know about other understanding and of
course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The e-book The Papers of Dwight
David Eisenhower: The Presidency: Keeping the Peace (Volume 19) is not only giving you far more new
information but also to be your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to
read your reserve. Try to make relationship while using book The Papers of Dwight David Eisenhower: The
Presidency: Keeping the Peace (Volume 19). You never truly feel lose out for everything should you read
some books.

Diana Chung:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice
by means of surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. Yes, by reading a guide your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand than other is
high. For yourself who want to start reading a book, we give you this specific The Papers of Dwight David
Eisenhower: The Presidency: Keeping the Peace (Volume 19) book as beginner and daily reading book.
Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Eric Baur:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the concept The Papers of
Dwight David Eisenhower: The Presidency: Keeping the Peace (Volume 19) suitable to you? Typically the
book was written by popular writer in this era. The book untitled The Papers of Dwight David Eisenhower:
The Presidency: Keeping the Peace (Volume 19)is the main one of several books that will everyone read
now. This particular book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this publication you
will enter the new dimensions that you ever know ahead of. The author explained their plan in the simple
way, and so all of people can easily to recognise the core of this guide. This book will give you a lots of



information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world with this book.
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