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Why does conflict deteriorate into violence and war? How does collective memory influence healing and
social justice in post-conflict situations? What is the role of judicial accountability - Crime Tribunals and
Truth Commissions - for past violations of human rights?

This book brings together a distinguished group of scholars, policy-makers, justice workers and social
activists to answer these questions. In a creative engagement with issues of human rights in relation to truth,
healing and social justice, they look at how people rebuild broken communities and the tensions between
reconciliation and social justice in post-conflict situations.

The book is structured round the themes of social justice, the nature of conflict, judicial accountability and
the role of truth commissions. Opening with Wole Soyinka's exploration of 'that burden of memory that a
continent seeks to exorcise through the strategy of reparations', the first part of the book addresses questions
of social justice as both ends and means of healing and reconciliation. The contributors go on to look at the
nature and dynamics of conflict while parts three and four consider judicial accountability and the role of
truth commissions as approachs to healing and social justice. The book concludes with a chapter on the
pursuit of justice as an underlying cause of civil wars in Africa and elsewhere.

Exploring the cases of Uganda, Sudan, Rwanda, South Africa, Nigeria, Latin America and the former
Yugoslavia and including consideration of the gendered elements of conflict, this book is urgent reading for
students and academics in peace and conflict and African Studies.
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From reader reviews:

Larry Parker:

Throughout other case, little folks like to read book The Politics of Memory: Truth, Healing and Social
Justice. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. Providing we know about how is
important a new book The Politics of Memory: Truth, Healing and Social Justice. You can add know-how
and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can recognize
everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple matter until
wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, you can open a book or maybe searching by internet
gadget. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's read.

Jeff Sanchez:

The book untitled The Politics of Memory: Truth, Healing and Social Justice contain a lot of information on
that. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy way. The language is very clear and understandable
all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read it. The book was compiled by famous author. The
author gives you in the new time of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can continue
reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to
buy the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice read.

Robert Beck:

It is possible to spend your free time to read this book this publication. This The Politics of Memory: Truth,
Healing and Social Justice is simple to develop you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train in
addition to soon. If you did not include much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the
particular e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone.
Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Joseph Boyd:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a book we can know
everything we want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This book The Politics of Memory: Truth, Healing and Social Justice was
filled regarding science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines
competence. Some people has different feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big
selling point of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like right now, many
ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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