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“Lawyers Gone Bad,” is the story of beleaguered attorney disciplinary counsel, Dean Alessi, and his trusty
investigator, Stu Foley, in their fight against lawyers gone bad – that is, lawyers who commit ethical and
criminal wrongs. In this case they’re investigation the local District Attorney who may have committed the
ultimate ethical wrong - murder.

Novelist Vincent Scarsella draws on his over 18 years of real life experience as head of the Eighth Judicial
District Grievance Committee in Buffalo, New York to craft a gripping, suspenseful novel about lawyers
gone bad.

But the story is more than a crime novel. It concerns friendship, loss, unrequited love, and ultimately, justice.
It seeks to answer the question, does what goes around, come around? "Lawyers Gone Bad,” follows on the
success of Vincent Scarsella’s debut crime novel, “The Anonymous Man”, about which The Buffalo News
said: "’The Anonymous Man’ gets decent marks for creativity and intricacy...it's a fast read that runs through
familiar local settings to a satisfying conclusion. Scarsella has the makings of a good storyteller...he and
[Jack] Fox could go places."

Editorial Reviews

"Scarsella spices [his tale] with saucy language when needed and street lingo where appropriate. He keeps
the suspense at high level until the answers unfold." -- The Buffalo News - May 31, 2015
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From reader reviews:

Michael Moore:

With other case, little men and women like to read book Lawyers Gone Bad (A Lawyers Gone Bad Novel).
You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important a
new book Lawyers Gone Bad (A Lawyers Gone Bad Novel). You can add understanding and of course you
can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can recognize
everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple matter until
wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or searching by internet gadget.
It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's examine.

Floyd Hatfield:

Now a day folks who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not need people to be aware of each facts they get. How a lot more to be smart
in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Looking at a book can help
individuals out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Lawyers Gone Bad (A Lawyers Gone Bad
Novel) book because this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the data in this book
hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Barbara Mobley:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity this is look different
you can read a new book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can
spent the entire day to reading a reserve. The book Lawyers Gone Bad (A Lawyers Gone Bad Novel) it is
extremely good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These were enjoying reading
this book. If you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can
m0ore simply to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book features high
quality.

Scott Rochelle:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. A single activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you have been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Lawyers Gone Bad (A Lawyers Gone
Bad Novel), you may enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of
hang-out type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout people. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its named
reading friends.
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