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Biography of one Jane Addams best friend written after Julia Lathrop's death. As one of the four members of
the inner circle at Hull-House, Julia Lathrop played an instrumental role in the field of social reform for more
than fifty years. Working tirelessly for women, children, immigrants and workers, she was the first head of
the federal Children's Bureau, an ardent advocate of woman suffrage, and a cultural leader. She was also one
of Jane Addams's best friends. My Friend, Julia Lathrop is Addams' lovingly rendered biography of a
memorable colleague and confidant. The memoir reveals a great deal about the influence of Hull-House on
the social and political history of the early twentieth century. An introduction by long-time Addams scholar
Anne Firor Scott provides a broader account of women's work in voluntary associations.
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From reader reviews:

Clementine Frazier:

The book My Friend, Julia Lathrop can give more knowledge and information about everything you want.
So why must we leave the good thing like a book My Friend, Julia Lathrop? A few of you have a different
opinion about reserve. But one aim this book can give many information for us. It is absolutely proper. Right
now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, you can give for each
other; it is possible to share all of these. Book My Friend, Julia Lathrop has simple shape but the truth is
know: it has great and large function for you. You can search the enormous world by start and read a
publication. So it is very wonderful.

Pedro Turk:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information these days can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider when those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take My Friend, Julia Lathrop as the daily resource
information.

Richard Bennett:

The reserve untitled My Friend, Julia Lathrop is the e-book that recommended to you to study. You can see
the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you. The language that publisher use to explained
their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of exploration when write the book, and
so the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of
My Friend, Julia Lathrop from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Mac Cutter:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the
library or to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's
heart and soul or real their pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library.
They go to presently there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that looking at is not
important, boring along with can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is
very important for you personally. As we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we
wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this My Friend, Julia Lathrop can
make you feel more interested to read.
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