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Do you know what’s a million times better than getting to the top of the mountain?

Getting there after having been lost.

Ohhh yeah,
The Universe
 
The 60 cards in this beautifully illustrated deck give Mike Dooley’s fans a new way to experience his
signature Notes from the Universe, quirky, funny messages that remind readers to love their lives and trust
their dreams. Based on Mike’s essential credo that “Thoughts Become Things” and we can choose the
thoughts we want to realize, these cards are loving reminders that we’re responsible for our own
happiness—and that it’s already within reach.

Launched in 1998 as an e-mail sent out weekly to 38 addresses, Mike’s “Notes from the Universe” has
blossomed into a daily mailing to over 700,000 subscribers in 185 countries. The Notes in this deck, set off
by photographs of nature’s own gorgeous and richly varied abundance, are brief passages designed to remind
us that we could not possibly be more loved, more powerful, or more deserving of all that our hearts desire.
“Today, you are a magnet for infinite abundance, divine intelligence, and unlimited love,” the Universe tells
us. “Actually, this has always been true.” 
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From reader reviews:

Michele Sexton:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing for us
to know everything in the world. Each publication has different aim as well as goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are reading
whatever they have because their hobby is reading a book. Why not the person who don't like studying a
book? Sometime, individual feel need book after they found difficult problem or maybe exercise. Well,
probably you'll have this Notes from the Universe on Abundance: A 60-Card Deck.

Maurice Conner:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this Notes from the Universe on Abundance: A
60-Card Deck guide written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that may be
understand by anyone who have read the book. Written with good manner for you, dripping every ideas and
writing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still skepticism Notes from the Universe
on Abundance: A 60-Card Deck as good book not only by the cover but also through the content. This is one
publication that can break don't assess book by its cover, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to
pick this!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to one more sixth
sense.

Dora Mohammed:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You
will see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. Typically the book that recommended
for your requirements is Notes from the Universe on Abundance: A 60-Card Deck this e-book consist a lot of
the information on the condition of this world now. This book was represented how do the world has grown
up. The terminology styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some
research when he makes this book. That's why this book acceptable all of you.

Richard McCormick:

Beside this kind of Notes from the Universe on Abundance: A 60-Card Deck in your phone, it could possibly
give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you can got
here is fresh from your oven so don't be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow community. It is
good thing to have Notes from the Universe on Abundance: A 60-Card Deck because this book offers to
your account readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you seldom get what it's interesting
features of. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable blend here
cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss that? Find this



book along with read it from now!
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