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L. Frank Baum is most well known for his book "The Wonderful Wizard of Oz", but in fact he was a prolific
writer of children's books, having written over 50 novels, 80 short stories, 200 poems, and other various
writings. These works were written using a number of different pseudonyms, including Capt. Hugh
Fitzgerald, Laura Bancroft and Floyd Akers. He is known in his works to have been a great predictor of
future technologies and events, such as the laptop computer in "The Master Key", and cordless phones in
Tik-Tik of Oz.

Born on May 15, 1856 in New York in a small town called Chittenango, Baum's parents, Benjamin Ward
and Cynthia Stanton, were both deeply religious Methodists, but that didn't stop him from having a very
happy childhood with his nine siblings during the late 1850s through most of the 1860s. Due to his parent's
religion, he and his siblings were schooled at home, meaning that other than his brothers and sisters, he had
relatively few friends outside his home. This gave him a lot of time to read books from his father's extensive
collection, where he quickly learned to hate the moral stories of the time and their usage of violence and
terrifying monsters to get to the moral of the story. This is definitely where he found inspiration for his Oz
books later in life, wanting to create stories that children, including his own, could read without having
nightmares.
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From reader reviews:

Edith Macklin:

Now a day those who Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not require people to be aware of each facts they get. How many people to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Wizard of Oz : The Complete
Collection [Books 1 - 17 ] (Annotated & illustrated) book because book offers you rich info and knowledge.
Of course the information in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Rosa Reid:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also get a life style. This reading addiction give you lot of
advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the book which
improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of e-book you read,
if you want drive more knowledge just go with education books but if you want experience happy read one
with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Typically the Wizard of Oz : The Complete
Collection [Books 1 - 17 ] (Annotated & illustrated) is kind of reserve which is giving the reader erratic
experience.

Gary Lewis:

This Wizard of Oz : The Complete Collection [Books 1 - 17 ] (Annotated & illustrated) are reliable for you
who want to be described as a successful person, why. The key reason why of this Wizard of Oz : The
Complete Collection [Books 1 - 17 ] (Annotated & illustrated) can be one of many great books you must
have is giving you more than just simple studying food but feed an individual with information that maybe
will shock your preceding knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it all over the place and
whenever your conditions in e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this Wizard of Oz : The Complete
Collection [Books 1 - 17 ] (Annotated & illustrated) giving you an enormous of experience for example rich
vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that could it useful in your day task. So , let's have it
appreciate reading.

Anthony Koch:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is prepared or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled update of
news. In this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying to
find the Wizard of Oz : The Complete Collection [Books 1 - 17 ] (Annotated & illustrated) when you
necessary it?
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