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A Portable Identity: A Woman's Guide to Maintaining a Sense of Self While Moving Overseas, Revised
Edition, is written by two former expatriate spouses who are also counselors. The book educates and
empowers expatriate spouses to take charge of the changes in identity that occur during an international
relocation. The most profound change a woman will experience when she moves overseas in support of her
husband's career comes from within herself, to her own sense of identity. With two, three, or more years of
an overseas assignment, a woman faces the formidable task of creating a life for herself in an unfamiliar
country. Unlike any other book about overseas living, this book explains with clarity, candor and
compassion, how each stage of the move affects a woman's identity. A Portable Identity is an interactive
book with practical exercises and inspiring stories. It is designed to be a companion and guide for the woman
who wants to know how her identity is affected at each stage of the move, from pre-departure to arrival, and
while living overseas. The book also explains why the thoughts and feelings she may experience as an
expatriate spouse are normal within the context of so much change, and how she can use the steps of The
Wheel to shape her identity in a way that honors her sense of self while living in a foreign country and
culture, as well as during repatriation. A Portable Identity is essential reading for military, corporate, non-
governmental organization, missionary, and foreign service spouses. By learning how to take charge of
change, a spouse can make choices for a happier and more meaningful life overseas. The result is a more
successful transition to life abroad and a more "portable" identity that can thrive away from home. A
Portable Identity is also a valuable resource for professionals, including human resource managers,
international relocation specialists, employee assistance professionals and therapists. The book provides
them with critical information that they can utilize to better assist the accompanying spouse during an
international move...
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From reader reviews:

Ann Bland:

The book A Portable Identity: A Woman's Guide to Maintaining a Sense of Self While Moving Overseas,
Revised Edition can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you
want. Exactly why must we leave the good thing like a book A Portable Identity: A Woman's Guide to
Maintaining a Sense of Self While Moving Overseas, Revised Edition? Some of you have a different opinion
about book. But one aim that book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to
closer together with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, you may give for each other; you
could share all of these. Book A Portable Identity: A Woman's Guide to Maintaining a Sense of Self While
Moving Overseas, Revised Edition has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and big function
for you. You can appearance the enormous world by open up and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Nora Cordova:

Now a day people that Living in the era wherever everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not require people to be aware of each data they get. How people have to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this A Portable Identity: A Woman's Guide
to Maintaining a Sense of Self While Moving Overseas, Revised Edition book as this book offers you rich
data and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you
may already know.

Christi Shoup:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition details. Even you love A Portable Identity: A Woman's
Guide to Maintaining a Sense of Self While Moving Overseas, Revised Edition, you may enjoy both. It is
very good combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh occur its mind
hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

Audrey Mack:

Reading a book for being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book. When
you read a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your
knowledge, simply because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on
what forms of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your study, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, such us
novel, comics, in addition to soon. The A Portable Identity: A Woman's Guide to Maintaining a Sense of



Self While Moving Overseas, Revised Edition will give you a new experience in reading a book.
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