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Living The Remote Dream details my journey to make an impact in the world without being constrained by
the concept of a conventional workplace. This guide will enable more of us to travel the world, spend more
time with our families, and be even more productive.

The daily commute has become an ingrained part of modern society, largely defined by what was necessary
to communicate and share ideas decades ago. In the Internet age, the globe is far smaller. Connectivity is
abundant, and collaborating with colleagues sitting in different continents is no longer the challenge it once
was. As the walls of communication have been shattered by e-mail, video chats and telepresence solutions,
it’s time that we redirect the resources we’re spending on our 9 to 5 treks.

This book provides step-by-step guidance in planning for a remote transition, tackling the topic with your
boss, and working to ensure that you’re even more productive when left to define your own office.

You’ll learn what’s in my arsenal of gadgetry, and which tools I lean on most to hone my focus and
productivity. You’ll understand that getting away from the grind is oftentimes what is needed to find the
clarity you’ve been seeking.

You’ll also learn a little about me, my journey through the halcyon years of tech blogging, and what careers
are best suited for remote working arrangements.

Living The Remote Dream delivers practical, actionable advice on how to pivot your career into a remote
one. For those who long for more freedom and flexibility — and are willing to work for it — this guide is for
you.
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From reader reviews:

Mildred Patton:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that question above. Every person has several
personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Living the Remote Dream: A Guide
To Seeing the World, Setting Records, and Advancing Your Career. All type of book could you see on many
methods. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Kim Gray:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be update about what going on or details even knowledge
to make them keep up with the era that is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe can update
themselves by reading books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming to you is you
don't know which one you should start with. This Living the Remote Dream: A Guide To Seeing the World,
Setting Records, and Advancing Your Career is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why,
because book serves what you want and want in this era.

Dianna Chrisman:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Living the Remote Dream: A Guide To Seeing the
World, Setting Records, and Advancing Your Career was vibrant and of course has pictures on the website.
As we know that book Living the Remote Dream: A Guide To Seeing the World, Setting Records, and
Advancing Your Career has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or
Investigator Conan you can read and think that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book
are generally make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for
yourself and try to like reading in which.

Eli Benton:

A number of people said that they feel fed up when they reading a guide. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half regions of the book. You can choose the particular book Living the Remote Dream: A Guide
To Seeing the World, Setting Records, and Advancing Your Career to make your personal reading is
interesting. Your personal skill of reading proficiency is developing when you including reading. Try to
choose simple book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the idea about book and studying
especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to open a book and study it. Beside that the reserve Living
the Remote Dream: A Guide To Seeing the World, Setting Records, and Advancing Your Career can to be
your brand new friend when you're feel alone and confuse with what must you're doing of that time.
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