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We may know pornography when we see it, but the business of pornography is a surprisingly elusive subject.
Reliable figures about the industry are difficult to come by and widely disputed, but one matter that is hardly
debatable is that pornography is a major and ubiquitous enterprise. Porn allegedly accounts for one-third of
all internet traffic currently, though the data about actual consumption is unclear. Reports in recent years
have suggested that 70 million individuals visit porn sites every week; that among viewers aged 18-24,
women watch more porn than men; and that among middle-aged, white-collar workers, three-quarters of men
and half of women have admitted to looking at pornography websites while at work.

While debates and emotions around porn can run high, there is a crucial need for reliable information and
rational conversation. In this book, Shira Tarrant parses the wide range of statistics that we have on the
pornography industry, sorting myth from reality in an objective, fascinating and knowledgeable fashion. She
looks at ongoing political controversies around the industry, the feminist porn wars, the views of the
religious right, the history of pornography, landmark legal cases, and the latest in medical research. The
Pornography Industry also explains the industry basics -who works in porn, why people become performers,
how much they earn, and what happens on a porn set. It further delves into important questions such as: how
many teenagers watch porn and should we worry about it? What is porn piracy and can it be stopped? What
can the industry do about sexist and racist pornography? Does porn cause violence against women? Can
people become addicted to porn? Is watching porn the same as infidelity? By presenting competing
perspectives in an even-handed way, The Pornography Industry will enable readers to explore these
provocative issues and make their own best decisions about the debates.
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From reader reviews:

Alvin Pryor:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this The Pornography Industry: What
Everyone Needs to Know book written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that can be
understand by anyone who all read the book. Written with good manner for you, still dripping wet every
ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still uncertainty The Pornography
Industry: What Everyone Needs to Know as good book not merely by the cover but also through the content.
This is one publication that can break don't determine book by its deal with, so do you still needing one more
sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already told you so why you have
to listening to a different sixth sense.

Solomon Pepper:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can have
it in e-book method, more simple and reachable. This The Pornography Industry: What Everyone Needs to
Know can give you a lot of close friends because by you investigating this one book you have factor that
they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of one step
for you to get success. This reserve offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't realize, by
knowing more than additional make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? Let us have The Pornography
Industry: What Everyone Needs to Know.

Daniel Padilla:

A lot of book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by net on social media. You can
choose the most effective book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it.
It is identified as of book The Pornography Industry: What Everyone Needs to Know. You can add your
knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make anyone
happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one destination to
other place.

Harry Blalock:

Many people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt this when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the particular book The Pornography Industry: What Everyone
Needs to Know to make your current reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading ability is
developing when you including reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy to study it
and mingle the opinion about book and looking at especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to
available a book and read it. Beside that the book The Pornography Industry: What Everyone Needs to Know
can to be your brand new friend when you're feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing of the time.
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