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A brand new collection of state-of-the-art management skills and techniques
 
Master today’s most valuable management skills! Get hundreds of bite-size, easy techniques for hiring,
collaboration, motivation, negotiation, and much more!
 
Moving into management? Moving up in management? To compete and succeed, you need today’s best
skills for managing, motivating, and collaborating with others. That’s exactly what you’ll find in this
extraordinary 4 book package. Build a great team with Cathy Fyock’s  The Truth About Hiring the Best :
discover how to identify the best, reach them, recruit them, and choose among them! Cathy Fyock presents
53 bite-size, easy-to-use hiring techniques for finding hidden sources of talent… making great people want
to work for you… asking the right questions… listening for the right answers… hiring like your
organization’s future depends on it, because it does! Next, get the best from the people you have, with the
latest version of Martha Finney’s classic,  The Truth About Getting the Best from People . Finney’s
expanded and improved Second Edition offers 60+ proven principles for achieving employee engagement
practically 100% of the time. She’s added more than 15 brand-new truths for managing virtual teams,
becoming more persuasive, overcoming unconscious biases, identifying and cultivating individual high
performers, and more. Then, optimize your management effectiveness with Stephen P. Robbins’s  The Truth
About Managing People, Third Edition:  61 real solutions for the make-or-break problems faced by every
manager. Learn how to overcome the real obstacles to teamwork… why too much communication can be as
dangerous as too little… how to improve hiring and employee evaluations… how to heal “layoff survivor
sickness”… how to manage a diverse culture, and lead effectively in a digital world. This edition is packed
with new truths, including: how to nurture friendlier employees, manage a diverse age group, and lead
ethically in tough times. Finally, in  The Truth About Negotiations,  Leigh L. Thompson teaches 46 proven
negotiation principles: quick, easy ways to become a world-class negotiator. You’ll learn how to prepare for
a negotiation within one hour… negotiate with people you hate (or love)… clearly identify your “best
alternative” if a deal isn’t possible… use reason, respect, and reciprocity to extract a deal’s maximum
potential value… create win-win solutions… establish enduring relationships. From hiring to motivation,
negotiation to collaboration, this collection gives you hundreds of new best practices and skills for world-
class management and leadership!
 
From world-renowned management and HR experts  Cathy Fyock, Martha I. Finney, Stephen P.
Robbins, and Leigh Thompson
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From reader reviews:

Ellen Wirth:

Inside other case, little folks like to read book The Truth About Managing Effectively (Collection). You can
choose the best book if you want reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important a book The
Truth About Managing Effectively (Collection). You can add information and of course you can around the
world by just a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can recognize everything! From your
country till foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you could know
that. In this era, we are able to open a book or searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You may use it
when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's learn.

Zola Campbell:

Book will be written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Next to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A reserve The Truth About Managing Effectively
(Collection) will make you to become smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about
everything. But some of you think that open or reading any book make you bored. It's not make you fun.
Why they might be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or suited book with you?

Juan Carrillo:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they're still students or it for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
several personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't want do
that. You must know how great in addition to important the book The Truth About Managing Effectively
(Collection). All type of book could you see on many sources. You can look for the internet resources or
other social media.

Angel Martinez:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen need book to know the revise information of year to be able to year. As we know those books have
many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. Through the
book The Truth About Managing Effectively (Collection) we can get more advantage. Don't you to definitely
be creative people? For being creative person must want to read a book. Just choose the best book that ideal
with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life with this book The Truth About Managing Effectively
(Collection). You can more attractive than now.
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