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This book is the first to focus on why and how foreign Western women engage in cross-border sexual and
intimate relations as tourists travelling, or temporarily dwelling, in a Central American country. As an in-
depth ethnographic account, the book traces the experiences of heterosexual North American and European
women’s transnational encounters, and examines new sexual and social practices arising from contemporary
global tourism, shifting sexual cultures both at home and abroad, consumer culture, and women’s increasing
mobility. The book combines descriptions of women’s travels and sexual relations across racial and class
boundaries with feminism, postcolonial theory, and poststructuralist theories of gender and sexuality, to
show how tourism as a wide range and set of desires serves as a central shaping force in the formation of
women’s sexual subjectivities in contemporary life in postindustrial capitalism. In doing so it offers new
insights into how tourist women express heterosexuality shaped by gender, race, class, and identities.

This fascinating book, focusing on the structure of tourism and role of local culture and social organization
in the shoring-up of desire, develops a unique contribution to the understanding of sex tourism. It will be of
interest not only to tourism scholars, but also to those interested in sexuality, anthropology, sociology,
cultural studies, women studies, gender studies, and geography.
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From reader reviews:

Jack Crawford:

This Sexuality, Women, and Tourism: Cross-border desires through contemporary travel (Contemporary
Geographies of Leisure, Tourism and Mobility) usually are reliable for you who want to be considered a
successful person, why. The reason of this Sexuality, Women, and Tourism: Cross-border desires through
contemporary travel (Contemporary Geographies of Leisure, Tourism and Mobility) can be one of several
great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed you
with information that perhaps will shock your previous knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can
bring it just about everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed versions. Beside that this
Sexuality, Women, and Tourism: Cross-border desires through contemporary travel (Contemporary
Geographies of Leisure, Tourism and Mobility) giving you an enormous of experience such as rich
vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we know it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it
and enjoy reading.

Markus Walker:

Often the book Sexuality, Women, and Tourism: Cross-border desires through contemporary travel
(Contemporary Geographies of Leisure, Tourism and Mobility) will bring that you the new experience of
reading a new book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book you
just read, this book very acceptable to you. The book Sexuality, Women, and Tourism: Cross-border desires
through contemporary travel (Contemporary Geographies of Leisure, Tourism and Mobility) is much
recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can quicker to read
the book.

Jose Pina:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Aim to pick
one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its deal with may doesn't work at this
point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside search
likes. Maybe you answer is usually Sexuality, Women, and Tourism: Cross-border desires through
contemporary travel (Contemporary Geographies of Leisure, Tourism and Mobility) why because the great
cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content will
be fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly guide you to pick up this
book.

Kevin Diaz:

You can find this Sexuality, Women, and Tourism: Cross-border desires through contemporary travel
(Contemporary Geographies of Leisure, Tourism and Mobility) by visit the bookstore or Mall. Just simply



viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties to your knowledge.
Kinds of this book are various. Not only through written or printed and also can you enjoy this book through
e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what their
problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most
important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose suitable
ways for you.
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